MINUTES OF MEETING
FULTON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
COMMISSIONERS SESSION ROOM

JUNE 2, 2011
9:00:52 AM
Call Meeting to Order
Pledge of Allegiance
Opening Prayer
Roll Call Attendance — All members present

Resolution 2011-535 Approve Minutes of May 31, 2011

Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:03:15 AM
Resolution 2011-536 Approve Agenda As Amended

Commission Rupp indicated that he would like to amend the agenda to include a follow up discussion on
the EMS contracts under old business. Commissioner Rupp made the motion and Commissioner Barnaby
seconded the motion. Motion carried unanimously.

OLD BUSINESS:

- Resolution 2011-537 Approve Payment of Bills

Commissioner Genter made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:05:27 AM
-Review Dog Warden Reports for Week Ending 5/28/2011
It was noted that the standard operating procedures adopted by the board have gone into effect as of June
1%, Weekly meetings with the Wardens will begin on June 13" and will follow each session Monday
thereafter at 9:30 a.m.

9:06:04 AM
-Review Notice from Ohio Department of Commerce Regarding Census Information

9:07:34 AM
Discussion on EMS

Resolution 2011-545
Form an EMS Panel for Fire Chief’s Contract and Appoint Dean Genter as Commissioners’
Representative
Commissioner Rupp stated that as a follow up to Tuesday’s discussion he would like to make a motion
for the formation of a panel to discuss the EMS/Fire Chiefs’ contract. This panel will be responsible for
bringing back a plan to the Board of Commissioners for review and adoption. He included in his motion
that he would like to appoint Commissioner Genter as the Commissioners’ Representative to this Board.
He noted that having something ready by August 15-30 would give them time during the
September/October months to fine tune it and have something in place by November. Commissioner
Barnaby seconded the motion. Motion carried unanimously.

9:09:25 AM
NEW BUSINESS:

- Resolution 2011-538 Approve ALS Waiver
Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.
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9:09:52 AM
- Resolution 2011-539 Authorize Create and Renaming of Positions for Sanitary Engineer and Approve
Requisition for Water and Sewer Technician | for Sanitary Engineer and Authorize Advertisement of the
Same
Ziad Musallam, Sanitary Engineer, was present for the discussion. He stated that a current technician,
Kenny Cowell, will be retiring at the end of July and it is necessary to hire a replacement. The current
Water and Sewer Technician position being held by Rick Meiring shall be renamed to Water and Sewer
Technician 11, with the same job duties as he currently holds, while the new position created will be titled
as Water and Sewer Technician I. This position will be an aide to the W&S Tech I, will require no
license, and will work under his and Rick Meiring’s license. This position would go into effect August 1
with a 180-day probationary period. Pay is DOQ.

Commissioner Genter stated that for interviewing, he would like the Board to see the list of all applicants.
Ziad Musallam and Andy Votava will take the lead on the interviewing and the final 3 candidates will
come before the Board for interviewing.

Mr. Musallam noted that this is a 35 hour/week position, with some overtime required, but will flex hours
to avoid as much overtime as possible.

Commissioner Genter made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.
Address Water Complaint Received
Commissioner Genter inquired of a water complaint that was received by John O’Neill. The matter had
been investigated and a formal response should be issued. Mr. Musallam will draft a letter for the Board
to sign and bring it to them for signatures for Monday.

9:18:56 AM
- Resolution 2011-540 Declare Improvement to Pleasant View Wastewater Treatment Plant a Necessity
Mr. Musallam explained that this is a follow up to their previous discussion on the improvement of the
existing Pleasant View Wastewater Treatment Plant. The EPA has determined, pursuant to a sampling of
the effluent waters, that improvements are needed to the facility due to the age of the plant and the
presence of a pond. After an evaluation, it was determined that the most effective, reliable and feasible
improvement is to provide for sand filters and eliminate the existing pond. To prevent further degradation
of the area’s surrounding environment, the Board is responsible for the construction, operation, and
maintenance of the sanitary sewer facilities per ORC 86117.

The estimated cost of the project is at $100K. A CDBG application through the Water and Sewer
Program has been submitted, which, if granted, will cover 50% of the project costs. The rest will be
financed through WPCLF for 20 years at 0% interest. Commissioner Genter inquired if Formula funds
can be used. Mr. Musallam stated that in his discussions with Steve Brown, if that is the Board’s
decision, they can apply for that also. He indicated that an income survey of the area indicated that it is
52% LMI which would qualify them for funding through the Formula grant. Commissioner Barnaby
instructed Mr. Musallam to do whatever is needed to get any grant funding that is available for this.

Commissioner Genter inquired if an examination has been done of the existing structure out there? The
poles in the ground have been there for over 40 years. They need to dig down around those poles to see
what is there. Commissioner Rupp agreed stating that a big snow or wind could collapse the building.

Mr. Musallam elaborated on the timeline stating that the improvement must be in place and operational
by the end of the year. He will advertise for bids once the funding is in place. The application for the
RLF is going out today. The Environmental Review is being done by the Regional Planning Office. That
will be sent out as soon as finished also.

Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.
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It was noted that this will NOT result in a special assessment to be levied or collected to pay for any part
of the cost of this improvement and shall be paid for with sewer user charges.

9:26:09 AM
- Resolution 2011-541 Establish Sewer Rate for Pleasant View Sewer System
As a follow up to the previous resolution, Mr. Musallam presented a resolution to establish a sewer rate
for the Pleasant View Sewer System to cover the additional operation, maintenance, replacement, capital
improvements, and regulations governing the use of the System. The amount of the monthly Fulton
County Sewer Rate will be $64.96 per Equivalent Dwelling Unit (EDU).

It was indicated that this charge is worst case scenario and will most likely be adjusted down.
Commissioner Genter made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:29:06 AM
- Resolution 2011-542 Increase and Transfer Appropriations In Northeast Water System Fund
Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:29:23 AM
Resolution 2011-543 Approve Then and Now Purchase Orders

Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Genter seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:29:40 AM
Resolution 2011-544 Approve Purchase Orders and Travel Requests
Commissioner Barnaby made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion. Motion carried
unanimously.

9:30:37 AM
Recess
9:34:47 AM
BID OPENING-2011-2012 Rock Salt
It was noted that this is being handled differently this year as the bidders have 3 options when submitting
a bid.

1. Bid A does not include a diesel fuel adjustment
2. Bid B includes a diesel fuel adjustment
3. Bidders can bid on either one or both

Bids were submitted as follows:

Detroit Salt Company
Detroit, Ml
NO BID

Central Salt LLC
Elgin, IL
NO BID

North American Salt Co.

Overland Park, KS

Bid Bond Submitted

Bid A = Delivered $66.39, Hauled by Co. $63.39
Pick up Location - Toledo

Bid B = Delivered $65.39

American Rock Salt
Mt. Morris, NY
NO BID
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Cargill Deicing Technology

North Olmsted, OH

Bid Bond Submitted

Bid A = Delivered $63.59, Hauled by Co. $60.00
Pick up Location - Toledo

Bid B=NO BID

Morton Salt

Chicago, IL

Bid Bond Received

Bid A = Delivered $65.81, Hauled by Co. $65.81
Pick up Location - Toledo

Bid B = Delivered $65.81

The bids were turned over to the Fulton County Engineer for review and recommendation for award of
bid.
9:42:04 AM
ADJOURN
Commissioner Genter made the motion and Commissioner Rupp seconded the motion.

Approved:

Paul D. Barnaby

Dean A. Genter

Perry L. Rupp

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk

A signed copy of the minutes or a recording of the meeting in its entirety can be obtained in the office of
the Clerk of the Board at 152 S. Fulton St, Ste 270, Wauseon, Ohio 43567.


ftr://?location=%22SESSIONROOMFTR%22?date=%2202-Jun-2011%22?position=%2209:42:04%22?Data=%2231b8598%22

RESOLUTION 2011-535

In the Matter of Resolution Approving ) Office of County Commissioners
Minutes of May 31, 2011 ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to notice,
on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the resolution herein.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that after review, the Fulton County Commissioners hereby
approve the minutes of Regular Session held May 31, 2011 as presented; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, by the Board of County Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of
Ohio that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Board of County Commissioners,
County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this resolution were adopted in an open
meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all deliberations of this Board of County
Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in such formal action, were in meetings open to
the public in compliance with all legal requirements including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the following
vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:

Paul D. Barnaby Paul D. Barnaby Paul D. Barnaby
Dean A. Genter Dean A. Genter Dean A. Genter
Perry L. Rupp Perry L. Rupp Perry L. Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk
Copy To: File



RESOLUTION 2011-536

In the Matter of Resolution to approve ) Office of County Commissioners
Agenda as Amended or Presented ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to
notice, on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members
present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, Commission Staff, to the best of its ability, has prepared the agenda for the day,
and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners has reviewed said agenda and find it to be
satisfactory as presented or as officially amended on the record in open session.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Fulton County Commissioners hereby
approve the agenda as amended or presented for: June 2, 2011; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this
Board of County Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this
resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all
deliberations of this Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in
such formal action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements
including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

This resolution was seconded by Commissioner and upon calling the
roll, the following vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:
Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk

cc: File



RESOLUTION 2011-537
In the Matter of Resolution Approving ) Office of County Commissioners,
Payment of Bills ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011
The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to
notice, on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members
present:
Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, the Fulton County Auditor certifies that the money for the credit of the bills listed
on the Disbursement List is in the Treasury for the credit of the Funds from which they are to be
paid, and is not appropriated for any other purpose.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners approve the payment of
bills as submitted, and;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, by the Board of County Commissioners, County of Fulton,
State of Ohio that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Board of County
Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this resolution were
adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all deliberations of
this Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in such formal
action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements including
Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the
following vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:

Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:
Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk




RESOLUTION 2011-545

In the Matter of Resolution Forming an EMS ) Office of County Commissioners,
Committee and Appointing Dean Genter as ) Fulton County, Ohio
Commissioners’ Representative ) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to notice,
on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with all members present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, the existing contract with the Fulton County Fire Chiefs is due to terminate on December
31, 2011; and

WHEREAS, to improve efficiency of the EMS structure the Board of Commissioners wishes to correct
any existing deficiencies in the current agreement and to negotiate a unified contract for all Fulton County
entities;

WHEREAS, the Board finds it to be in the best interest of Fulton County to form a Committee to assist
in negotiating a fair and reasonable contract with the Fire Chiefs’ for the period beginning January 1,
2012; and

WHEREAS, the Board further finds it necessary to appoint a Commissioners’ Representative to said
committee; and

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Fulton County Commissioners hereby form an EMS
Committee for the purposes of negotiating a fair and reasonable contract with the Fulton County Fire
Chiefs for the contract period beginning January 1, 2012; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the Fulton County Board of Commissioners hereby appoint
Commissioner Dean Genter as the Commissioners’ representative to serve on the EMS Committee for the
purposes set forth herein; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Board of
County Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this resolution were
adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all deliberations of this
Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in such formal action, were in
meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements including Section 121.22 of the
Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the following
vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:
Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk



RESOLUTION 2011-538

In the Matter of Approving Waiver of ) Office County Commissioners
Charges for ALS Transport ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to
notice, on June 2, 2011, at 152 S. Fulton St., Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio passed a policy in the
matter of approving the collection of delinquent charges for ALS service; and

WHEREAS, a balance currently remains of $1,077.00 for two (2) separate ALS Transports for a
county resident, Kyle Rochte. Mr. Rochte has submitted information evidencing financial
hardship and an inability to pay said balance; and

WHEREAS, the Board has the authority to waive said charges and forego further billing for
services rendered.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, for the reason stated hereinabove, the Fulton County Board
of Commissioners hereby approve the waiver of charges for Kyle Rotche, for the bills attached
hereto dated 9/27/2010 for the amount of $534.00, and 11/5/2009 for the amount of $543.00, in
the total amount of $1,077.00; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the county EMS Office is directed to waive the balance
owing and forego balance billing for services rendered hereinabove; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this
Board of county Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this
resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all
deliberations of this Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in
such formal action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements
including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the following
vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:
Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk

CC: Jodi Tuckerman; Journal



RESOLUTION 2011-539

In the Matter of Resolution to Authorize ) Office County Commissioners
Creation and Renaming of Positions for Sanitary) Fulton County, Ohio

Engineer and Approve Requisition for Water ) June 2, 2011

and Sewer Technician | for Sanitary Engineer )

and Authorize Advertisement of Same )

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to
notice, on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members
present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp
Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, the Sanitary Engineer has submitted his request for the creation of the position for a
full-time Water and Sewer Technician | and to rename the current Water and Sewer Technician
position held by Rick Meiring to Water and Sewer Technician Il to better define the roles,
responsibilities, and requirements of each position; and

WHEREAS, the Water and Sewer Technician Il position shall be to identify a Treatment Plant
Operator and the Water and Sewer Technician | position shall be to identify a Treatment Plant
Aide, both Classified positions under the supervision of the Sanitary Engineer; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Fulton County Commissioners are in accord with said request and
wishes to publicly advertise to fill the position of the Water and Sewer Technician I.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Fulton County Commissioners hereby authorize the
creation of the position for a full-time Water and Sewer Technician | and that the necessary
advertisement to fill said position shall be published in the Fulton County Expositor on June 7,
2011 and placed on the Fulton County Website at www.fultoncountyoh.com

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the position of Water and Sewer Technician currently held by
Rick Meiring shall be renamed to Water and Sewer Technician Il and holding the same roles,
responsibilities and requirements; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this
Board of County Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this
resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all
deliberations of this Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in
such formal action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements
including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the
following vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:
Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk

Copy To: Z. Musallam; A. Votava; File



RESOLUTION 2011-543

In the Matter of Resolution to Approve ) Office of County Commissioners,
Then and Now Purchase Orders and Payments ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to
notice, on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with the following members
present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

WHEREAS, the Fulton County Auditor has certified the following listed Then and Now
purchase orders and payments:

PO Number VENDOR# PO Date Amount
2011001170 BOUNDS50 5/23/2011 $ 85.45
2011001172 VILLA15 5/23/2011 180.00
2011001182 OHOP50 5/26/2011 27,905.34
2011001183 AIRIL40 5/26/2011 242.00
2011001185 EMERG40 5/26/2011 3,885.50
2011001194 MNJTE50 5/26/2011 865.00
2011001195 MNJTE50 5/26/2011 865.00
2011001196 OWENSG60 5/26/2011 1,775.00
2011001197 OWENSG60 5/26/2011 1,775.00
3 37,578.29

WHEREAS, it is certified that both at the time that the contract or order was made (“then”), and
at the time that the County Auditor is completing the certification (“now), that sufficient funds
were available or in the process of collection, to the credit of the proper fund, properly
appropriated and free from any previous encumbrance; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Ohio Revised Code 85705.41(D)(1), these purchases must be approved
by resolution of the Board of Commissioners; and

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, the Board of Commissioners hereby approve the Then and
Now Purchase Orders as certified by the County Auditor; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, by the Board of County Commissioners, County of Fulton,
State of Ohio that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Board of County
Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this resolution were
adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all deliberations of
this Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in such formal
action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements including
Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner
following vote was taken:

seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:

Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby

Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter

Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

cc: Auditor Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk



RESOLUTION2011-544
In the Matter of Resolution Approving ) Office of County Commissioners,
Purchase Orders and Travel Requests ) Fulton County, Ohio
) June 2, 2011

The Board of County Commissioners of Fulton County, Ohio met in regular session pursuant to notice,
on June 2, 2011, at 152 South Fulton Street, Wauseon, Ohio, with all members present:

Commissioners Paul Barnaby, Dean Genter, and Perry Rupp

Commissioner moved for the adoption of the following resolution:

BE IT RESOLVED , that the Fulton County Commissioners will sign a Purchase Order computer edit
list prepared by the Fulton County Auditor, in addition to signing each individual purchase order, if
necessary. Said Purchase Order Edit List will be on file in the Fulton County Commissioners Office in
lieu of being journalized, and;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners approve travel requests as submitted,
and;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Board of
County Commissioners, County of Fulton, State of Ohio concerning the adoption of this resolution were
adopted in an open meeting of this Board of County Commissioners, and that all deliberations of this
Board of County Commissioners and of any of its committees that resulted in such formal action, were in
meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements including Section 121.22 of the
Ohio Revised Code.

Commissioner seconded the resolution and upon calling the roll, the following
vote was taken:

Voting Aye thereon: Voting Nay thereon: Abstain:
Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby Paul Barnaby
Dean Genter Dean Genter Dean Genter
Perry Rupp Perry Rupp Perry Rupp

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FULTON COUNTY, OHIO

Attest:

Jennifer L. Connors, Clerk

Copy To: File
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